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The Bay Area Air Quality Management District (Air District) is a 
regional government agency, committed to achieving clean air to pro-
tect the public's health and the environment. The Air District accom-
plishes this goal through regulation of industrial facilities and various 
outreach and incentive programs designed to encourage clean air 
choices. 
 
The Air District's jurisdiction encompasses all of seven counties — 
Alameda, Contra Costa, Marin, San Francisco, San Mateo, Santa Clara 
and Napa, and portions of two others — southwestern Solano and 
southern Sonoma. 
 
The Air District is currently accepting applications for the position of 
Manager in the Finance Office. This is an open recruitment for 
two (2) full-time, exempt, management positions.  
 
The Finance Office is responsible for maintaining the fiscal steward-
ship and financial accountability of the District. These responsibili-
ties include accounting activities, financial audits and reporting, 
vendor payments, receipt of permit fees, asset management and 
maintenance of the District’s financial system.  The office is also re-
sponsible for the development of the District’s annual budget and 
annual cost recovery analysis, the fiscal maintenance and financial 
reporting of all federal and state grants. 
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ABOUT THE POSITION: 
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Directs, organizes, assigns, reviews, and evaluates the work of as-
signed staff; selects and trains staff and provides for their profes-
sional development. 
 
Directs the preparation, maintenance, verification, and reconciliation 
of a wide variety of reports. 
 
Develops and implements goals, objectives, policies, procedures, and 
work standards for the assigned programs. 
 
Develops, reviews, and recommends improved methods and proce-
dures. 
 
Directs the maintenance of and maintains accurate records; prepares 
clear and concise reports, correspondence and other written materi-
als. 
 
Analyzes technical issues, prepares and presents reports and recom-
mendations regarding operational and policy issues to the Board, var-
ious committees, and other groups. 
 
Analyzes and reviews local, state, and federal legislation to determine 
its impact on the District. 
 
Responds to requests for public information regarding the District's 
policies, procedures and operations. 
 
Represents the District and assists the Director/Officer as assigned. 
 

EXAMPLES OF DUTIES: 



MINIMUM QUALIFICATIONS 
 
Education & Experience 
 
A typical way to obtain the knowledge and skills is: 
 
Equivalent to graduation from a four (4) year college or university 
with major coursework in a job-related field and four (4) years of 
professional level work experience preferably in a public agency, of 
which at least two (2) years were at a supervisory level. Some posi-
tions may require specialized training, education and experience. 
 

DESIRABLE QUALIFICATIONS 
 
Government accounting and budgeting experience in highly desira-
ble. 
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QUALIFICATIONS: 
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Salary: $145,626.89– $177,010.40 Annually 

COMPENSATION &  
BENEFITS: 
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HOW TO APPLY 
 
Interested individuals must submit a completed Air District applica-
tion, chronological resume, and responses to the supplemental ques-
tionnaire by 5:00 p.m. on February 14, 2022.  Applications are 
accepted online; please visit our website at www.baaqmd.gov/jobs 
to apply. 
 
SUPPLEMENTAL QUESTIONS INSTRUCTIONS 
 
Individuals who apply for this position must respond to each of the 
required supplemental questions. Applications must be received by 
the Human Resources Office no later than the time and date specified 
in this vacancy announcement. The responses to the supplemental 
application questions will be used in accordance with the procedures 
indicated under the Selection Criteria section. 
 
SELECTION CRITERIA 
 
Selection may be based upon a competitive examination consisting 
of a written exercise, interview, or combination of the two. Depending 
on the number of qualified applicants, an application screening and/or 
panel interview may be used to determine the most qualified ap-
plicants. 
 
The Air District may hire from this recruitment process to fill future 
vacancies occurring within the next 18 months. 
 
Equal Employment Opportunity 
 
It is the Air District’s policy to provide equal employment opportuni-
ties for all persons without regard to race, religious creed, color, na-
tional origin, ancestry, disability, medical condition, marital status, 
sex, age or sexual orientation. 
 

Human Resources Office 
415.749.4980 
HR_Staff@baaqmd.gov 
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